

BID OPENING

BID NAME: SUB-CONSTRUCTION OF NGCISININDE - GADHODO
ACCESS ROAD PHASE 1

BID NO: MNG/SCM/03/24-25

CLOSING DATE: 15 AUGUST 2024

TIME: 12H00

COMPANY NAME	CONTACT PERSON	CONTACT NO	SIGNATURE
MNDUMA L MUNICIPALITY	S. DWAKA	047 050 1155	
MNDUMA L MUNICIPALITY	Z. KUTWANA	047 050 1152	
MNDUMA L MUNICIPALITY	M. SOMPETHA	047 050 1155	
SMS Maintenance	Ra Mokoena	0663674286	
MAYIVUTHE CONTRACTORS	M. JACKY	0787741606	
JT MARTIS ELECTRICAL	Z Zinto	0661943414	
ISWE IHLI Holdings	S. Mekupule	0738673927	

COMPANY NAME

AMOUNT

1. STIM INVESTMENTS (PTY) LTD	R NO TENDER OFFER
2. TRIPPLER GLIMMER	R 232 310.00
3. TINIGRI GENERAL TRADING	R NO TENDER OFFER
4. LOYISO OUTSOURCING	R 399 947.91
5. BETROOT TRADING & PROJECTS	R 5000.00
6. ZANDKHANYO TRADING CC	R 24 75.00
7. SIR GIDI & ASSOCIATES	R 761 620.00
8. YIRHA INTSIKA	R 55 300.00
9. INGKAOSI TRADING 239CC	R 76 150.00
10. ELEVEN D LAND TRADING	R NO TENDER OFFER
11. BULUMKO PROJECTS (PTY) LTD	R 141 970.00
12. ALUNGAKO TRADING (PTY) LTD	R NO TENDER OFFER
13. SUK HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD	R 40 302.05
14. SANIMATE (PTY) LTD	R 24 100.00
15. BACK TO URBAN (PTY) LTD	R NO TENDER
16. ASIZU TRADING	R NO TENDER OFFER

CONTINUATION

BID NAME: SUB-CONSTRUCTION OF NGCENINDE-GEEDWOP ACCESS ROAD PHASE 1

BID NO: MNR/SCM/03/24-25

CLOSING DATE: 15 AUGUST 2024

TIME: 12H00

COMPANY NAME

AMOUNT

17. ZENITHLONIPHE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	R NO TENDER OFFER
18. BLACK INVESTMENT TRADING AND PROJECTS	R NO TENDER OFFER
19. SADIUMBE GROUP	R 429 450.00
20. SKHONZA NENKOMO	R NO TENDER OFFER
21. PERFECT ABOLITION (PTY) LTD	R 85 850.00
22. LIBUKHAKI HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD	R NO TENDER OFFER
23. SAKHE MINCE TRADING (PTY) LTD	R 52 499.59
24. X-SIX BUILDERS CC	R NO TENDER OFFER
25. AVOGLO (PTY) LTD	R NO TENDER OFFER
26. BEACON PEAKS DEVELOPERS (PTY) LTD	R NO TENDER OFFER
27. LIKHATYISE PROJECT (PTY) LTD	R NO TENDER OFFER
28. NIKIWE DEVELOPMENT PROJECTS	R 158 860.00
29. KOMANISI B COMMUNICATIONS	R 64 080.00
30. IYKO LEXO TRADING 409	R NO TENDER OFFER
31. NDZO WETHU ENGINEERING	R 34 201.90
32. BUTLE A TRADING AND PROJECTS	R NO TENDER OFFER
33. NGYEKE TO ENTERPRISE	R NO TENDER OFFER
34. INYGELOSI CORPORATE (PTY) LTD	R 253 744.00
35. BONISIPHO TRADING	R NO BID OFFER.
36. KENTMARK GROUP	R NO BID OFFER
37. SMS HB MAINTAINANCE	R NO BID OFFER
38. BUJA CAPITAL	R NO BID OFFER
39. 178 RIM ENTERPRISE	R NO BID OFFER
40. NOZULU CAPITAL SERVICES	R 223 288.60
41. GIKUS AND DLAKS	R 49 910.00

CONTINUATION:

BID NAME: SUB-CONSTRUCTION OF NGCISINDE - GEDWOOD ACCESS
PHASE 1

BID NO: MNB/SCM/03/24-25

BIDDING DATE: 15/08/2024

TIME: 12H00

COMPANY NAME	AMOUNT
42 QWESHA GROUP (PTY) LTD	R 58 875.00
43 MPOUNILE GENERAL TRADING	R 43 990.00
44 HEBE HEBE TRADING (PTY) LTD	R 34 218.25
45 IFEZELILE TRADING (PTY) LTD	R NO BID OFFER
46 TABAZI PROJECTS	R NO BID OFFER
47 IQUNUBE GENERAL SERVICES	R 56 608.75
48 MAFUYA INVESTERS (PTY) LTD	R 98 360.00
49 AFRICAN CHOW TRADING	R NO BID NUMBER OFFER
50 INENDY BUHLEBEZWE TRADING	R NO BID OFFER
51 ZTB HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD	R 275 699.85
52 KUMNKAM TRADING (PTY) LTD	R 85 330.00
53 ULUYOHO INVESTMENTS	R NO TENDER OFFER
54 SANITRIM	R 350.00
55 OKU DEVELOPERS (PTY) LTD	R NO BIDDER OFFER
56 ZYIKOZA HOLDINGS (PTY) LTD	R NO BIDDER OFFER
7 WILLING WAVE 08 SOLUTIONS	R 55 141.35
8 ISWE ELIHE HOLDINGS	R NO BID OFFER
9 JUSPO CONSTRUCTION AND CIVILS	R NO BID OFFER
10 MDLUNGU HOLDINGS	R NO BID OFFER
11 SILULU TO (PTY) LTD	R NO BID OFFER
2 DEX CONSULTING & SERVICES	R NO BID OFFER
3 BLACK STAR LINE GROUP	R 273 510.25
1 KHONKWA CIVILS AND BUILDING (PTY) LTD	R NO BID OFFER
5 2 DAYS TRADING CC	R NO BID OFFER
ANELINE TRADING (PTY) LTD	R NO BID OFFER

CONTINUATION

BID NAME: SUB-CONSTRUCTION OF ^{NGCISINDE} ~~NGCISINDE~~ - CEDWOOD
ACCESS ROAD PHASE 1

BID NO: MND/SLM/03/24-24

CLOSING DATE: 15/08/2024

TIME: 12H00

COMPANY NAME

AMOUNT

67. ALUWORTH ALUMINIUM	R NO BID OFFER
68. LA TOA CONSULTING	R NO BID OFFER
69. LIBRANON TRADING	R 244 990.25
70. GILTYE TRADING (PTY) LTD	R NO BID OFFER
71. SINYONDO TRADING (PTY) LTD	R 57 925.00
72. AMAZIZI ENTERPRISE (PTY) LTD	R NO BID OFFER.
73. BUSISA GENERAL SUPPLIERS (PTY) LTD	R NO BID OFFER
74. WILLING WAVE 08 SOLUTIONS PTY	R NO BID OFFER
75. THSANANA TRADING EVENTS	R NO BID OFFER

SEVENTY FIVE (75) BID DOCUMENTS RECEIVED

MINQUMA LOCAL MUNICIPALITY
SUPPLY CHAIN
MANAGEMENT UNIT

2024-08-15

Received By: S. Dwaka

Signature: *[Signature]*